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professional preset automix with
the unique option called "strip"

that enables users to strip an audio
sample and leave only the full or
main melodic part. It also has a

dedicated automation function for
non-linear automation and the

presets are editable. If your
project has multiple stems, you
can set up a set of predefined

effects, and then drag and drop the
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stems into a set to automate the
process. At the bottom of the Mix

window is a Strip button which
enables you to strip a sample and

leave only the full or main
melody. The Strip button can be

used to mute the low/high end of a
sample, which is ideal for setting

up aggressive presets. The
automation window can be a bit
confusing at first - fortunately,
there's an 'Instant' button which
instantly changes the automation

configuration of the selected
track. Automix 13 can also be
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used as a sequencer by setting up a
grid of tracks and automated tape
loops, allowing you to create your
own music in a jiffy. All of the

automated elements can be easily
re-arranged by simply drag the

automated track to a new place in
the grid. The automation tools are
very efficient in finding the exact

locations of melodies and
instrumentation, and supports the
following resolutions: This means

that you can always find the
specific place within your audio

files where a track has been
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automated, making automation a
snap. This means that you can
always find the specific place

within your audio files where a
track has been automated, making

automation a snap. Once
everything is recorded, Automix
13 will automatically sort out the
automated beats in an intuitive

way. To make your project a little
more creative, you can also record

the automation chain onto the
MIDI track using Automix 13's
MIDI recording function. If you

like the idea of starting from
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scratch but don't want to get out
your old software, Automix 13's
brand new 'fresh start' mode is

available as an additional option.
If you like the idea of starting

from scratch but don't want to get
out your old software, Automix

13's brand new 'fresh start' mode
is available as an additional option.

However, if you don't want to
waste time doing this, we've also
included an optional 'automatic
fresh start' mode which has the
effect of starting your project
directly from an existing track
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