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TORONTO – To prevent the suspect in the

Toronto van attack from fleeing the country,
Canada issued an Interpol Red Notice against

a Kuwait-born suspect identified as Ahmad
Dahman. “The Red Notice is a request by

Canada to all agencies that are party to the
Convention to arrest and detain Ahmad

Dahman at the request of Canadian
authorities,” said a spokesman for the

Department of Justice. “The Red Notice will
affect all countries parties to the Interpol
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General Bureau Agreement (GBA), the
convention that Interpol is based on.” A Red
Notice will inform law enforcement and other

relevant agencies of the wanted person’s
nationality, identity and location, and may

request information from other Interpol
member countries. Story continues below

advertisement Interpol’s General Secretariat
does not disclose this type of information to

other countries; however, an intercepted Red
Notice alert is visible on a particular Interpol

member country’s website. Ottawa also issued
an “Access to Criminal Assets and

Investigative Techniques (ACTA)” treaty
request. WATCH: Police suggest driver

involved in van attack may have ties to “a
terrorist organization” 1:37 Police suggest

driver involved in van attack may have ties to
‘a terrorist organization’ Police suggest driver

involved in van attack may have ties to ‘a
terrorist organization’ “An ACTA request

essentially requests criminal information of a
criminal, including their financial and/or other
assets. It can only be used in the case of an
extradition,” said the spokesman. Dahman
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was identified as a suspect by Canadian
police, who are treating the case as a

potential terrorist attack. READ MORE: Prime
Minister Justin Trudeau says Canada gun laws
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